IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF PENNSYLVANIA

IN RE: ZOLOFT (SERTRALINE

HYDROCHLORIDE) PRODUCTS

LIABILITY LITIGATION

MDL NO. 2342 12-MD-2342

:

HON. CYNTHIA M. RUFE

THIS DOCUMENT APPLIES TO:

ALL ACTIONS

:

PRETRIAL ORDER NO. 26

AND NOW, this 26th day of April 2013, upon consideration of the application for fees and costs incurred by Special Discovery Master Andrew Chirls for the month of March 2013 (see attached), which was submitted both to the Court and Liaison Counsel pursuant to Pretrial Order No. 22, and finding that the work, fees and costs reflected thereon are "reasonably necessary" for the fulfillment of the Special Discovery Master's duties, and without objection from counsel, it is hereby **ORDERED** that the application for fees and costs is **APPROVED** in full. Accordingly, the parties are responsible for payment of an equal half share of the same.

It is so **ORDERED.**

BY THE COURT:

CYNTHIA M. RUFE. J



ANDREW A. CHIRLS DIRECT DIAL 215-246-2216 EMAIL ACHIRLS@HAINES-LAW.COM

April 11, 2013

The Honorable Cynthia M. Rufe United States District Court, Eastern District of Pennsylvania James A. Byrne U.S. Courthouse 601 Market Street, Suite 12614 Philadelphia, PA 19106-1797

RE: In re: Zoloft (Sertraline Hydrochloride) Products Liability Litigation,

MDL No. 2342

Dear Judge Rufe:

Consistent with the compensation provisions of Pretrial Order No. 22 in the above-captioned matter, I am submitting a statement of counsel fees and costs recorded through the end of March 2013. I am serving a copy on Plaintiffs' and Defendants' Liaison counsel and on Plaintiffs' Co-Lead Counsel.

I will be happy to submit a more complete motion or application and file it of record with the Clerk if that is what the Court desires.

The second of the second secon

Respectfully,

NDREW A. CHIRLS

AAC/

cc: Mark S. Cheffo, Esquire (by email/.pdf)

Katherine Armstrong, esquire (by email/.pdf) Stephen A. Corr, Esquire (by email/.pdf)

Dianne M. Nast, Esquire (by email/.pdf)

Mark P. Robinson, Jr., Esquire (by email/.pdf)

HAINES & ASSOCIATES

1835 Market Street Suite 2420 Philadelphia, PA 19103

(215) 246-2200

Tax I.D. No. 83-0384937

Dianne M. Nast, Esquire Mark R. Robinson, Esquire Mark S. Cheffo, Esquire Katherine Armstrong, Esquire

Statement Date: Statement No. Account No. March 31, 2013 1981 357.00

Page: 1

RE: Zoloft Products Liability Litigation 12-MD-2342

Services Rendered

03/01/2013 AC	Brief discussion and correspondence w/ court (0.2); correspondence w/ counsel (0.2); review PTO 22 (0.2)	0.60	315.00
03/04/2013 AC	Review various pre-trial orders and other materials in public record	2.00	1,050.00
03/05/2013 AC	Conference call w/ counsel (0.6); follow up correspondence (0.1)	0.70	367.50
03/06/2013 AC	Review transcripts(2.2); corr. w/ counsel (0.4)	2.60	1,365.00
03/07/2013 AC	Corr. w/ counsel (0.3); review transcripts (1.7)	2.00	1,050.00
03/12/2013 AC	Letters from M. Cheffo, counsel for defendants, M. Robinson, plaintiffs' exec. committee	0.80	420.00
03/14/2013 AC	Discuss w/ Judge Rufe (0.3); review some of the cases and materials cited in the letters from PEC and defense counsel (0.8)	1.10	577.50
03/15/2013 AC	Call from D. Nast; corr: re: attendance at conference (0.3); corr w/ request for additional documents (0.2); review parts of additional documents sent by PEC (0.4)	0.90	472.50
03/18/2013 AC	Review submissions of 3/15 from PEC and from Pfizer counsel; make notes and prepare for meeting	1.50	787.50
03/19/2013 AC	Meeting w/ counsel (and preparation)	2.60	1,365.00

Page: 2 03/31/2013 357-00H 1981

357-00H Invoice No: 1981

Zoloft Products Liability Litigation 12-MD-2342

03/20/2013 AC	Correspondence follo	wing up on mee	etina: corresponde	nce re: dates						
AO	Correspondence following up on meeting; correspondence re: dates agreed on					0.20	105.00			
03/21/2013 AC	Review submissions of revised scheduling orders; discuss w/ law clerk					0.40	210.00			
03/26/2013 AC	Call w/ D. Nast; begin drafting report					0.20	105.00			
03/27/2013 AC	Report and recommendation; revisions to order; comments from the parties 2.00									
03/28/2013 AC	Revise Report and Recommendation and draft PTOs; calls w/ chambers						840.00			
SS	Electronic filing of the Special Discovery Master's Report and Recommendation No. 1 and downloaded to document management system.						25.00			
	For Current Services	Rendered				19.40	10,105.00			
Fee Summary										
Timekeeper Andrew Chirls Sandy Schmehl				<u>Hours</u> 19.20 0.20	Rate \$525.00 125.00	<u>Total</u> \$10,080.00 25.00				
<u>Costs</u>										
03/19/2013 03/26/2013	Miscellaneous Advar Photocopy Charges	ice - catering.					23.50 2.85			
	Total Costs Incurred						26.35			
	Total Fees and Costs		10,131.35							
	Balance Due Upon Receipt						\$10,131.35			
	<u>Fees</u> 10,105.00	<u>Hours</u> 19.40	Billing History Costs 26.35	Finance Cl	narge F 0.00	Payments 0.00				