

Schnader Harrison Segal & Lewis LLP

Suite 3600
 1600 Market Street
 Philadelphia, PA 19103
 (215) 751-2000

Joseph J. Zonies, Esq.
 Reilly Pozner LLP
 511 Sixteenth Street, Ste 700
 Denver, Colorado 80202

Date September 8, 2010
 Invoice Number 2293155
 Client No 0897106

Nina M. Gussack, Esquire
 Pepper Hamilton LLP
 3000 Two Logan Square
 Eighteenth and Arch Street
 Philadelphia, PA 19103

For Professional Services Rendered through August 31, 2010

Matter Number	Matter Name	Fee Amount	Cost Amount
0897106-0003	Avandia MDL	\$ 16,083.00	42.83
Total Services			\$ 16,083.00
Total Costs			42.83
Total Services and Costs			\$ 16,125.83
Total Due			\$ <u>16,125.83</u>

Due upon receipt

Please send payments by check to:
 SCHNADER HARRISON SEGAL & LEWIS LLP
 P O BOX 8500-6030
 PHILADELPHIA, PA 19178-6030
 (Please reference client# and invoice# on check.)

Please send payments by wire transfer to:
 WACHOVIA BANK
 BROAD AND WALNUT STREETS
 PHILADELPHIA, PA 19107
 ABA#: 031201467 ACCOUNT#: 2000049309139
 (Please reference client# and invoice#.)

Federal tax identification number: 23-1383844

Please enclose the remittance copy of this invoice with your payment to ensure proper credit. Questions may be directed to our billing department at 215-751-2514. Note that payments received after the invoice date are not reflected

United States District Court

0897106-0003

Avandia MDL

Date	Name	Description	Hours
08/02/10	BPM	Review Burford letter.	0.30
08/03/10	JJS	Accumulated briefs and correspondence; discussion with B. Merenstein; discussion with counsel; new deposition issues and briefs; supplemental case specific reports.	5.00
08/05/10	BS	Review docs. for update to index	0.10
08/06/10	BS	Update index, sub-folder docs.	0.20
08/09/10	JJS	Review summary judgment papers re: Buford filed by GSK; also beginning review of Daubert material.	2.70
08/10/10	JJS	Calls Aug. 5, 6 and 10 and various memos and reports; calls to Gussack and Andrus ; review of outstanding items with B. Merenstein and M. Newman; discussion with Court re: settlement conference, misc. accumulated.	2.20
08/10/10	BS	Review docs. for index, update index, subfolder docs.	0.20
08/11/10	JJS	More exhibits and memos from PSC; analysis of 5/5 issues.	1.70
08/12/10	JJS	Further material from counsel; review and analysis.	0.60
08/16/10	JJS	Briefs, memos re: further hearings; settlement meetings; misc.	2.40
08/18/10	JJS	Further correspondence and emails re: summary judgment motions; further motions from counsel arrangements re: settlement conference.	2.20
08/19/10	JJS	Memo from counsel and motions.	0.40
08/19/10	BS	Review docs., update index, sub-folder docs., follow up re: 8/9 motion (GSK)	0.30
08/20/10	BPM	Review motion re expert reports; call w/J. Zonies re response schedule.	0.60
08/20/10	BS	Review docs. requested for index, update index, subfolder documents/motions	0.30
08/24/10	BPM	Call w/J. Shestack; review confidential document letter.	0.50
08/25/10	JJS	Preparation for meeting; meeting with Court and various counsel; review extensive filing by PSC after return to office.	3.40
08/25/10	BPM	Attend conference w/J. Rufe; review Lone Pine motion; review PSC letter.	3.80
08/27/10	JJS	Voluminous material from counsel; Lonestar motions; Daubert material; Grey material briefs and misc.; draft recommendations.	3.30
08/27/10	BPM	Review PSC letters, exhibits, calls w/S. Fahey.	0.60
08/31/10	JJS	Voluminous reply for summary judgment motion in Belford cases; memo of law; exhibits; draft recommendation; meeting with B. Merenstein; Pepper reply on experts supplemental reports.	3.10

Page: 3
 Schnader Harrison Segal & Lewis LLP

September 8, 2010
 Invoice No: 2293155

United States District Court

0897106-0003 Avandia MDL

Date	Name	Description	Hours
08/31/10	BPM	Meet w/J. Shestack; review letters.	1.00

Total Services \$ 16,083.00

Name	Rate	Hour	Value
Bruce P. Merenstein	450.00	6.80	3,060.00
Barbara Schramm	180.00	1.10	198.00
Jerome J. Shestack	475.00	27.00	12,825.00
		34.90	\$ 16,083.00

Description	Amount
Duplicating	6.16
Outside Courier/Messenger	15.00
Postage	11.57
Teleconference	10.10

Total Costs Amount \$ 42.83

Total Services and Costs \$ 16,125.83