

**IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF PENNSYLVANIA**

**IN RE: AVANDIA MARKETING, SALES
PRACTICES AND PRODUCTS LIABILITY
LITIGATION**

**MDL No. 1871
07-md-01871**

**THIS DOCUMENT APPLIES TO:
ALL ACTIONS**

PRETRIAL ORDER NO. 148

AND NOW, this 5th day of December 2011, upon consideration of the applications for fees and costs incurred by Special Master Patrick Juneau for fees and expenses incurred through October 31, 2011 (see attached), and finding that the work, fees and costs reflected thereon are “reasonably necessary” for the fulfillment of the Special Masters’ duties, and without objection from counsel, it is hereby **ORDERED** that the applications for fees and costs are **APPROVED** in full. Accordingly, the parties are responsible for payment of an equal half share of the same.

It is so **ORDERED**.

BY THE COURT:


CYNTHIA M. RUFÉ, J.

JUNEAU DAVID

P.O. Drawer 51268
Lafayette, LA 70505-1268
Tax ID 72-1250097

November 15, 2011

HON. CYNTHIA M. RUFÉ
UNITED STATES DISTRICT JUDGE
EASTERN DISTRICT OF PENNSYLVANIA
601 MARKET STREET
ROOM 12614
PHILADELPHIA, PA 19106

Invoice #: 22462
Billed Through: October 31, 2011
Account #: 001300 01129

RE: IN RE: AVANDIA
MDL 1871
OUR FILE: 1300-1129

CURRENT FEES THROUGH:	October 31, 2011	\$49,880.00
CURRENT EXPENSES THROUGH:	October 31, 2011	\$6,064.56
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL		\$55,944.56
TOTAL NOW DUE		<u>\$55,944.56</u>

PLEASE INCLUDE INVOICE NO. ON YOUR CHECK.
**** PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT****

JUNEAU DAVID

P.O. Drawer 51268
 Lafayette, LA 70505-1268
 Tax ID 72-1250097

November 15, 2011

HON. CYNTHIA M. RUFÉ
 UNITED STATES DISTRICT JUDGE
 EASTERN DISTRICT OF PENNSYLVANIA
 601 MARKET STREET
 ROOM 12614
 PHILADELPHIA, PA 19106

Invoice #: 22462
 Billed through: October 31, 2011
 Account #: 001300 01129

RE: IN RE: AVANDIA
 MDL 1871
 OUR FILE: 1300-1129

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**Hours**

09/14/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BRUCE MERENSTEIN	0.30
09/14/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE RUFÉ RE: CASE INVOLVEMENT, STATUS AND MEETING TO DISCUSS SAME	0.40
09/25/11	PAJ	TRAVEL TO PHILADELPHIA AND PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCES	7.00
09/26/11	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH PARTIES AND SUBSEQUENT CONFERENCE WITH COURT	8.00
09/27/11	PAJ	RETURN TO LAFAYETTE, LOUISIANA AND REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS OBTAINED FROM THE COURT, INCLUDING REQUESTS FOR MEDIATION	7.00
09/27/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: AVAILABILITY FOR A CONFERENCE ON OCTOBER 17, 2011	0.10
09/27/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAUL KIESEL RE: MEETING WITH PARTIES AND CONFIRMING SAME FOR OCTOBER 6, 2011 IN LOS ANGELES	0.30
09/28/11	PAJ	EMAILS TO AND FROM PAUL KIESEL RE: AVAILABILITY FOR CONFERENCE ON OCTOBER 6, 2011	0.60
09/28/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: MEETING AND PROVIDING ADDITIONAL DATES FOR SAME	0.10
09/28/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BRUCE MERENSTEIN PROVIDING DAUBERT OPINION ON GENERAL CAUSATION, OPINION ON GSK'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT IN CONGESTIVE HEART FAILURE CASES AND OPINION ON GSK'S MOTION TO DISMISS CERTAIN CASES BASED ON THE STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS	2.00
09/28/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS RE: PROPOSED AGREEMENT SENT TO GSK AND PROVIDING COPY OF SAME	0.70
09/28/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NINA GUSSACK RE: CONFERENCE	0.10
09/29/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR DEFENDANTS	0.40
09/29/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BILL ROBINS	0.20
09/29/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY MCEWEN	0.40
09/29/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS CONFIRMING CONFERENCE CALL FOR SEPTEMBER 30, 2011 AND PROVIDING DETAILS FOR SAME	0.10
09/30/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE RUFÉ'S OFFICE	0.20

001300	01129	Invoice # 22462	Page 2
09/30/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PSC	0.80
10/03/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GREG MCEWEN	0.40
10/03/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM JOANNA VASSALLO, DIRECTED TO SCOTT PERLMUTER, REQUESTING MEDICAL RECORDS ON EIGHT PLAINTIFFS	0.10
10/03/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NINA GUSSACK RE: COORDINATION OF SETTLEMENT	0.10
10/04/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: RECENT SUBMISSION AND PROVIDING A CERTAIN DOCUMENT TO PLAINTIFFS	0.10
10/04/11	PAJ	PREPARING PROPOSED JOINT MOTION AND ORDER RE: DUTIES AND RESPONSIBILITIES OF SPECIAL MASTER AND AFFIDAVIT	1.40
10/04/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE RUFÉ RE: PROPOSED JOINT MOTION AND ORDER	0.10
10/04/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE RUFÉ'S OFFICE RE: JOINT MOTION	0.10
10/04/11	PAJ	REVISIONS TO JOINT MOTION TO APPOINT SPECIAL MASTER AND EMAIL TO JUDGE RUFÉ'S OFFICE PROVIDING SAME	0.20
10/04/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GEORGE LEHNER	0.20
10/04/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEORGE LEHNER, RE: SETTLEMENT TERMS	0.40
10/04/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEORGE LEHNER PROVIDING MEDIATION STATEMENT WITH VARIOUS ATTACHMENTS	1.90
10/04/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM BILL ROBINS PROVIDING PLAINTIFFS' POSITION PAPER WITH NUMEROUS ATTACHMENTS	3.30
10/05/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE RUFÉ'S OFFICE APPROVING PROPOSED MOTION AND ORDER TO APPOINT SPECIAL MASTER AND REQUESTING THAT SAME BE SENT TO PARTIES FOR FILING	0.10
10/05/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO PARTIES RE: JOINT MOTION AND ORDER TO APPOINT SPECIAL MASTER, ADVISING THAT JUDGE RUFÉ'S APPROVAL AND REQUESTING THAT THEY EXECUTE AND FILE SAME	0.20
10/05/11	PAJ	TRAVEL TO LOS ANGELES AND PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE WITH PLAINTIFFS	7.50
10/06/11	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL AND RETURN TO LAFAYETTE	12.00
10/07/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO GEORGE LEHNER RE: CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS STATUS	0.10
10/07/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEORGE LEHNER RE: CONFERENCE CALL AND PROVIDING DETAILS FOR SAME	0.10
10/07/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GSK COUNSEL	0.70
10/07/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER APPOINTING SPECIAL MASTER	0.10
10/10/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS PROVIDING RESPONSE TO GSK'S PROPOSED TERMS	0.60
10/10/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO GSK COUNSEL PROVIDING PLAINTIFFS' RESPONSE CONCERNING SETTLEMENT TERMS	0.10
10/10/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO GEORGE LEHNER RE: UPCOMING MEETING, SEPARATION IN POSITIONS AND POSSIBLY MEETING WITH JUDGE RUFÉ	0.20
10/11/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS SEEGER	0.40
10/12/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO KIESEL AND ROBINS RE: MEETING WITH DEFENSE AND STATUS OF JOINT CONFERENCE	0.30
10/12/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GEORGE LEHNER	0.30
10/12/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BILL ROBINS	0.20
10/12/11	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS SEEGER	1.50
10/13/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NINA GUSSACK RE: MEETING ON OCTOBER	0.10

001300	01129	Invoice # 22462	Page 3
		17, 2011 IN PHILADELPHIA	
10/13/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS RE: ADVERTISING, JOINT CONFERENCE AND ADDITIONAL ISSUES	0.20
10/13/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: MEETING SET WITH JUDGE RUFÉ AT 11:00 A.M. ON OCTOBER 17, 2011	0.10
10/13/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE RUFÉ	0.50
10/14/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO ROBINS AND KIESEL RE: GSK'S RESPONSE	0.10
10/14/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM PAUL KIESEL RE: GSK'S RESPONSE	0.10
10/14/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEORGE LEHNER PROVIDING RESPONSE TO HEARD ROBINS SETTLEMENT TERMS PROPOSAL	0.40
10/14/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF DEFENDANT'S MOTION FOR CONTINUANCE, MEMORANDUM OF POINTS AND AUTHORITIES IN SUPPORT OF ITS MOTION AND EXHIBITS	0.50
10/16/11	PAJ	REVIEWING DOCUMENTS AND TRAVEL TO PHILADELPHIA FOR MEETING AND CONFERENCE	8.00
10/17/11	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH GSK REPRESENTATIVES AND SUBSEQUENT CONFERENCE WITH COURT	8.00
10/18/11	PAJ	REVIEWING SUBMITTED DOCUMENTS, WORKING ON AGENDA AND CONTEXT OF MEETING WITH COURT ON OCTOBER 26, 2011 AND RETURN TO LAFAYETTE	8.00
10/19/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS PROVIDING COMMENTS TO GSK'S COMMENTS ON SETTLEMENT TERMS	0.30
10/19/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF MOTION FOR SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE AND ORDER GRANTING SAME	0.20
10/19/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, ISSUES AND CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE RUFÉ ON OCTOBER 26, 2011	0.30
10/19/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NINA GUSSACK RE: AGREEMENTS AND CONFERENCE WITH COURT	0.10
10/19/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE RUFÉ RE: PROPOSED AGENDA AND BULLET POINTS FOR NEXT WEEK'S CONFERENCE	0.20
10/19/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH NINA GUSSACK	0.50
10/19/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM NINA GUSSACK RE: NOVEMBER 14, 2011 HEARING	0.10
10/19/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: PRESENTLY SCHEDULED MATTERS ON NOVEMBER 14, 2011	0.10
10/19/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY JACK STRELLIS RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/19/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY PETER HEPPNER RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/19/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY BRANDY SCURRIA RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/19/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY JOHN LOPATTO RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/19/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY JARROD TAKAH RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/20/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE RUFÉ RE: AGENDA AND BULLET POINTS FOR UPCOMING CONFERENCE	0.10
10/20/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS SEEGER	0.40
10/20/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GONZALES RE: MEDIATION	0.30
10/20/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY GONZALES RE: CAMBRE CLAIMS	0.30
10/20/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY DAVID FINE RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/20/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY PAMELA SOTOODEH RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/20/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY LINDA TURLEY RE: MEDIATION	0.20

001300	01129	Invoice # 22462	Page 4
10/20/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY PERCY SQUIRE RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/21/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY GONZALES CONFIRMING REPRESENTATION OF JAMES AND ELLA CAMBRE	0.10
10/21/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE RUFÉ RE: NEXT WEEK'S CONFERENCE	0.20
10/21/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO NINA GUSSACK RE: NEXT WEEK'S CONFERENCE	0.10
10/21/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM LEE ALBERT REQUESTING MEDIATION ON BEHALF OF HIS 11 CASES AND PROVIDING SPREADSHEET RELATING TO SAME	0.30
10/21/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GREG MCEWEN	0.50
10/21/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEORGE LEHNER RE: BASIC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND PROVIDING SAME	0.80
10/21/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY LEE FORMAN RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/21/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY SCOTT PERLMUTER RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/21/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY MARVIN SEIDMAN RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/21/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY TODD HAGEMAN RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/21/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JAYNE CONROY RE: INTEREST IN MEDIATION	0.20
10/24/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO PLAINTIFFS' ATTORNEYS RE: GSK SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT	0.10
10/24/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF GSK'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT BASED ON STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS	1.30
10/24/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS RE: ZONIES AGREEMENT	0.10
10/24/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO GEORGE LEHNER RE: ZONIES AGREEMENT	0.10
10/24/11	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY LEE ALBERT RE: MEDIATION	0.20
10/24/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZIMMERMAN LAW FIRM RE: MEDIATION PROCEDURES	0.30
10/24/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEORGE LEHNER RE: ZONIES AGREEMENT	0.20
10/24/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO BILL ROBINS RE: ZONIES AGREEMENT	0.10
10/25/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS SEEGER	0.40
10/25/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DIANNE NAST RE: STATUS	0.40
10/25/11	PAJ	PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE WITH COURT AND TRAVEL TO PHILADELPHIA FOR SAME	7.50
10/26/11	PAJ	CONFERENCES WITH COURT AND PARTIES AND RETURN TO LAFAYETTE	12.00
10/27/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHARLES JOHNSON RE: INVENTORY OF CASES	0.40
10/27/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GREG MCEWEN	0.30
10/28/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAUL KIESEL	0.40
10/28/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS SEEGER	0.50
10/28/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT RE: SUPERVISION	0.20
10/28/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO BILL ROBINS RE: STATUS	0.20
10/28/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GEORGE LEHNER	0.30
10/28/11	PAJ	REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER RE: MEDIATION PROGRAM	0.70
10/28/11	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE RUFÉ RE: PROPOSED ORDER	0.10
10/28/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GREG MCEWEN, DIRECTED TO JUDGE RUFÉ, RE: GSK'S PROPOSED ORDER	0.10
10/30/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PAUL KIESEL	0.40
10/31/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM PAUL KIESEL RE: PROPOSED ORDER	0.20
10/31/11	PAJ	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY FORMAN RE:	0.20

001300	01129		Invoice # 22462	Page	5
		SETTLEMENT			
10/31/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BILL ROBINS RE: ORDER			0.60
10/31/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS RE: CONFERENCE CALL FOR THIS AFTERNOON AND PROVIDING DETAILS FOR SAME			0.10
10/31/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BILL ROBINS RE: MEDIATION			0.10
10/31/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BILL ROBINS AND PAUL KIESEL			0.50
10/31/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GEORGE LEHNER			0.30
10/31/11	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM PAUL KIESEL PROVIDING PROPOSED PRETRIAL ORDER RE: MEDIATION AND NOTICE PERTAINING TO SAME			0.80
10/31/11	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS SEEGER			0.50
			124.70		\$49,880.00
PAJ	JUNEAU, PATRICK A.		124.70 hrs @	\$400.00 /hr	\$49,880.00
	Fee Recap Totals		<u>124.70</u>		<u>\$49,880.00</u>

EXPENSES

		<u>Amount</u>
09/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRFARE - PHILADELPHIA, PA	454.30
09/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA	35.00
09/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE CHARGE - PHILADELPHIA, PA	25.00
09/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA	26.80
09/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA	10.00
09/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA	49.75
09/27/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; HOTEL - PHILADELPHIA, PA	509.30
09/27/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA	35.00
09/27/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRPORT PARKING	20.00
09/27/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE CHARGE - PHILADELPHIA, PA	25.00
09/27/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA	39.65
10/05/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE FEE - LOS ANGELES, CA	25.00
10/05/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIR FARE - LOS ANGELES, CA	918.80
10/05/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - LOS ANGELES, CA	50.00
10/05/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - LOS ANGELES, CA	18.90
10/06/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRPORT PARKING	16.00
10/06/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; HOTEL & MEAL - LOS ANGELES, CA	307.14
10/06/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE FEE - LOS ANGELES, CA	25.00
10/06/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - LOS ANGELES, CA	50.00
10/06/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - LOS ANGELES, CA	24.75
10/16/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRFARE - PHILADELPHIA, PA	1,350.30
10/16/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE FEE - PHILADELPHIA, PA	25.00
10/16/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA	35.00
10/16/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA	42.90
10/17/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA	16.00
10/17/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA	58.75
10/18/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA	35.00
10/18/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; HOTEL - PHILADELPHIA, PA	619.78
10/18/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRPORT PARKING	20.00
10/18/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE FEE - PHILADELPHIA, PA	25.00
10/18/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA	55.80

001300	01129	Invoice # 22462	Page 6
10/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRFARE - PHILADELPHIA, PA		452.80
10/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE FEE - PHILADELPHIA, PA		25.00
10/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA		30.00
10/25/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA		36.90
10/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; TAXI - PHILADELPHIA, PA		30.00
10/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; BAGGAGE FEE - PHILADELPHIA, PA		25.00
10/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; MEALS - PHILADELPHIA, PA		49.50
10/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; HOTEL - PHILADELPHIA, PA		249.30
10/26/11	PATRICK A. JUNEAU; AIRPORT PARKING		16.00
10/31/11	COPYING		74.60
10/31/11	FACSIMILE		2.50
10/31/11	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE CHARGE		117.88
10/31/11	POSTAGE CHARGE		6.16
			<hr/>
			\$6,064.56

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES	\$49,880.00
TOTAL EXPENSES	\$6,064.56
TOTAL FEES & EXPENSES	\$55,944.56
TOTAL NOW DUE	<u><u>\$55,944.56</u></u>